DOC A: The only communication the mayor Ms Helen Gauci had discussed the activity with the
Council without indicating the budget required for such an event and no approval was
furthermore taken upon it. (Council Meeting February,2024: https://gharghurlc.gov.mt/wp-
content/uploads/2024/05/Minuti-tal-Laggha-80-li-saret-fid-9-ta-Frar-2024.pdf )

80/03 Komunikazzjoni mis-Sindku

80/03/01 [s-Sindku ressqet li nsibu sponsor/s ghal attivita tal-Boxing (11 ta’ Mejju 2024). Kien hemm gbil
unanimu.

80/03/02 Is-Sindku ressqet 1i nsibu sponsor/s ghat-Therik tal-Annimali (19 ta’ Mejju 2024). Kien hemm
qbil unanimu.

80/03/03 Is-Sindku ressqet li nsibu sponsor/s ghal Jum il-Gharghur (16 ta’ Lulju 2024). Kien hemm qbil
unanimu.

DOC B: An email from the Council confirming the event details and logistics arrangement of

event.

Weigh-In & Press Conference 10/05/2024 @ 4pm - Gharghur Local Council

|©‘ ) Reply ‘ &) Reply Al ‘ —> Forward

Man 06/03/2024 20:54

: Hal Council

Please be advised that the Weighing-In for Pjazza De Box Part 5 - Hal Gharghur 11, will Take place on Friday 10th May at 4 PM at the Local Council’s Main Hall on Level 2.

We require the association to call its fighters to be present at 3:15 PM and please also advise that parking is very limited and due to the presence of the media, we are to start at that stated time.
Kindly forward list of officials for entry to the VIP area which will be controlled by a Guest List at the entrance of/to the VIP area.
We look forward to receiving the list at your earliest convenience.

Thank you and regards,
Maria.
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DOC C: Poster of event confirming the event on the official social media FaceBook portal of the

Gharghur Local Council.

Hal Gharghur Local Council
4 3 May2024-Q

FIRST FIGHT AT 8:00 PM

ﬂ This free public event could not have boon possible had it not been for our partnors
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DOC D: First émail notice of final invoices of the Gharghur fight event payment settlement.

3
\ HAL GHARGHUR PARISH SQUARE
e

Final Invoices Gharghur Fight Night 2 11/05/2024
© | < Reply | & ReplyAll | —> Forward

Tue 21/05/2024 13:05

arghur.lc@gmail.com
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Dear Marija,

Good day.

Attached please find invoices relating to the expenses for Pjazza De Box - Hal Gharghur Fight Night Part 2.

You earliest settlementis kindly appreciated.

Regards,
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DOC E: Second email notice of final invoices of the Gharghur fight event payment settlement.

Re: Final Invoices Gharghur Fight Night 2 11/05/2024
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To Gharghur.lc@gmail.com Mon 08/07/2024 12:57

Hi Maria,
Good afternocon.

Urgent reminder for the outstanding amount of Eur. 20,200, in relation to Service Providers for the May 11th Gharghur Fight Night 11
We are now kindly urging the Council or it's sponsor to settle at the very easiest convivence.

Awaiting yours,

DOC F: MOU with Mayor Ms Helen Gauci attached to email of the gmail account and not the
official @gov.mt.

5/9/25, 8:44 AM
Gmail - Fwd: Helen Gauci

Fwd: Helen Gauci
1 message

Fri, May 9, 2025 at 8:41 AM

__________ Forwarded message ------——

From: Hal Gharghur Local Council <gharghur.lc@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 30 Apr 2025 at 09:17 = 4
Subject: Helen Gauci

To:

=~ Gharghur LC_20250430_082443.pdf
3 390K
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DOC G: MOU signed in agreement by Mayor Ms Helen Gauci on the 30" of April,2025.

Pjazza De Box - Gharghur Part 2 - Expenses Repayments

MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING

This Memorandum of Understgnding (MOU) is made and entered into as of
of the year 2025,

> ds s
the > day of '
by and between

The First Part (A):

who is residing at
i RO UL

. Malta, acting as the organiser of

art 2, under the auspices of the MJBA.

Mrs Helen Guaci

“Pjazza De Box

and

The Second Part (B):

bearer of ID: 3 D i who is the residing at
, Malta, acting as the Co-Owner

and Managing Director Cfmotional group.

The purpose of this MOU is to establish and formalize the financial agreement between Party A and Party B
regarding the payment of EUR 400 per month, amounting to & total of EUR 23,500.00, to be paid on the last working
Friday of each month. This sum represents the outstanding amount promised to pay for the expenses incurred by

*m relation to Pjazza De Box - Gharghur Part 2

Article 2: Terms of this agreement

arty B the sum of EUR 400 per month

a. Payment Amount: Party A agrees to pay P

b. Payment Schedule: Payments will be made on the last working Friday of each month until the total
agreed amount of EUR 23,500.00 is fulfilled. .

c. Recipient: Payments are to be made to (. Managing Director of _

Entertainment

Article 3: The Duration

s agree L ” 50 < ce c ce with the
I a 2me W ” remain | efe tu tjl the ull amou t of EUQ23. 000 1s bee I_)le(il accordance \
’ o
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